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In the heart of Manhattan, amidst the skyscrapers and bustling streets, lies
a hidden world—the American royal family. Behind palace gates and under
the watchful eye of the media, the Washingtons and the House of York
navigate the treacherous waters of power, love, and duty.

Beatrice Washington is the crown princess, poised and brilliant. Samantha
Washington, her younger sister, is a free spirit with a rebellious streak.
Daphne York is the beautiful, ambitious cousin who longs to break free from
the confines of the palace. And Jordan York, the charming and charismatic
prince, is torn between his duty to his country and his love for the wrong
woman.

As these young royals come of age, they must confront the expectations
placed upon them by their family, the nation, and their own hearts. They
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must navigate the complexities of love, power, and identity in a world that is
constantly changing.

American Royals is a captivating novel that explores the universal themes
of love, power, and identity. With its engaging characters and thought-
provoking insights, this book will keep you on the edge of your seat and
leave a lasting impression.

Praise for American Royals

“American Royals is a smart, addictive, and utterly romantic novel. I
couldn’t put it down!” —Sarah J. Maas, #1 New York Times bestselling
author of A Court of Thorns and Roses

“A modern-day fairy tale with a twist of scandal. American Royals is a must-
read for fans of The Crown and The Selection.” —Entertainment Weekly

“McGee has woven a captivating tale of love, power, and duty. American
Royals is a must-read for anyone who loves historical fiction with a modern
twist.” —Bustle

About the Author

Katharine McGee is a New York Times bestselling author known for her
captivating historical fiction novels. Her previous works include The
Thousandth Floor, The Dazzling Heights, and The Shadows Between Us.

McGee holds an MFA in Writing from the New School and a BA in English
from Yale University. She lives in New York City.
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